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Abstract 
Background: Children with disabilities, are entitled to the same rights as enshrined in UNCRC because of the universality of 

this document. However, children with any kind of disability are at a much higher risk of maltreatment, especially in 

developing countries. This dynamic may be shaped by a lack of adequate laws, policies, trained staff, and coordination along 

with social context. 

Objective: While writing this article, a detailed desk review was carried out to explore the policies and legislations relevant to 

rights and protection of children with special needs. A small study was also conducted to explore the present situation of 

children with disabilities in terms of abuse and neglect and how they can be safeguarded against neglect and abuse in 

Pakistan. 

Materials and Methods: We did detailed desk review of policies and legislations regarding protection of children. We also 

conducted 10 in-depth interviews to understand the condition of children with special needs in reference to child rights and 

child protection. Themes emerging from qualitative research are discussed to elaborate on the results.  

Results: Lack of awareness, illiteracy, parental poverty are risk factors whereas the joint family system contributes positively 

to the protection of children with disabilities. 

Conclusion: Linking with Pakistan’s commitments, policies, laws, existing systems, and social context, this study provides an 

insight on challenges, opportunities, and how the rights-based agenda of protecting children with disabilities can be taken 

forward. However, for more in depth knowledge of situation more detailed research needs to be conducted. 

Keywords: Children with disabilities, child abuse and neglect, child protection, Pakistan. 
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Introduction 
 

Although children have been victims of abuse and 
neglect since antiquity, attention was drawn towards 
their plight in the landmark paper “The Battered-Child 
Syndrome” by Henry Kempe as recently as 1962.1 
Since then there have been many significant advances, 
the latest being its inclusion as target 16.2 “end abuse” 
in the United Nations Sustainable Development 
Goals.2  
According to the United Nations Convention on the 
Rights of the Child3, all the rights are universal i.e. 
every child has the all the rights mentioned in the 
UNCRC, and these rights belong to each child of the 
world, irrespective of their country or place of origin, 
socio-economic status, race, or religion. Children with 
disabilities or difficult circumstances also have the 
same basic rights. These rights are linked to the 
responsibility of the state, society, and their parents or 
adult guardians. Unfortunately, thirty years since the 
signing and ratification of the United Nations 
Convention on the Right of the Child by all the 
countries of the world except the United States of 
America, these rights have yet to be implemented in 
their true spirit. According to the Kids Right Index 
2019 developed by Kids Rights and Erasmus 
University Rotterdam, an index that looks at how well 
the countries adhere to the UNCRC, there is gross lack 
of ‘enabling environment for child rights’ and right to 
life, health, education and protection in most 
countries.  
Employing the indexes scale range with 0.97 highest 
possible overall score of Iceland, ranking 16 on right to 
protection with a score of 0.99 to the lowest possible 
overall score of 0.2 of  Afghanistan (ranking 181) and 
ranking 136 on right to protection with the score of 0.5, 
Pakistan ranks 151 on the overall index with a score of 
0.5 and ranking 127 on the right to protection index 
with a score of 0.567.4 
Prevention and response to Child Abuse and Neglect 
also have not been uniform. These differ from region 
to region, country to country, district to district, and 
even within districts. These also differ from child to 
child according to the circumstances they are living in 
and according to the abilities and disabilities of the 
child. 
There is very limited research conducted on the 
maltreatment of children with disabilities, as this topic 
faces research challenges in the developed and the 
developing world, we have not come across any study 
conducted in South Asia or Pakistan. One reason may 
be that there are challenges related to definition and 

methodology in researching child abuse and neglect of 
children with disabilities.  
In this paper, we have tried to highlight the situation, 
advancements, and gaps in the provision of child 
rights, specifically protection rights to children with 
disabilities along with risk and protective factors 
within the Pakistani society.  
Officially called the Islamic Republic of Pakistan, 
Pakistan is located in South Asia and is the fifth most 
populous country in the world. With such a large 
multi-ethnic and diverse population, ongoing issues 
such as the fight against terrorism and a struggling 
economy (Burki & Ziring,2020), children with special 
needs have not been the state’s priority. With special 
emphasis on norms and attitudes attached to both 
disability and maltreatment along with the support 
structures present, this paper also looks at the socio-
ecological climate of Pakistan. Due to the lack of 
existing data, we conducted a qualitative study for a 
better understanding of contexts of child abuse and 
neglect in children with disabilities. 
 
Disability 
Disability has been defined differently over time. 
Persons having lost mental or physical functionality, 
having long term illness or neurological dysfunction 
are classified as a 'person with disability' by Australian 
disability standards.5 United Nations Convention on 
the Rights of Persons with Disability6  describes 
disability as an interaction of impairment and 
environmental barriers resulting in limitations in 
independent living. The medical definition of 
disability sees disability arising from the malfunction 
or failure of an individual body's system. This 
disability can be ameliorated, cured, or rehabilitated 
through intervention and the 'person with disability' 
(PWD) is expected to avail the services offered for 
treatment or rehabilitation.7 
According to the International Classification of 
Functioning, “disability is an umbrella term for 
impairment, participation restriction or activity 
limitations” which happens due to a person’s health 
condition or impairment and personal and 
environmental factors. An estimated 5.1% of children 
below the age of 14 have disabilities, with 0.7% having 
"severe disability".8 Poorer health outcomes, lower 
educational achievements (Filmer, 2008), less economic 
participation9, a high rate of poverty along with 
restricted participation and increased dependency 10, 
are all associated with disability. Additionally, it is 
seen that people from vulnerable populations are more 
susceptible to disability. Low-income countries have a 
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higher disability prevalence as compared to those from 
high-income countries.8 Children from poorer 
households and those from ethnic minority groups are 
at a significantly higher risk of disability, as seen from 
Multiple Indicator Cluster Surveys data.11 
 
Child Abuse and Neglect 
According to the Report of the Consultation of Child 
Abuse and Prevention, in World Health Organization 
Appendix12 “Child abuse or maltreatment constitutes 
all forms of physical and/or emotional ill-treatment, 
sexual abuse, neglect or negligent treatment or 
commercial or other exploitation, resulting in actual or 
potential harm to the child’s health, survival, 
development or dignity in the context of a relationship 
of responsibility, trust or power.”   
A review looking at a series of meta-analyses on child 
abuse and neglect prevalence research suggested that 
the global prevalence for child sexual abuse can be 
estimated to be 7.6% for boys and 18.0 % for girls. The 
prevalence for children experiencing child physical 
abuse is 22.6%, 35.3% for emotional abuse, and 18% for 
neglect 13. A critical review of 29 studies, focusing on 
adult retrospective reports, indicated that a 
considerable overlap is found in the forms of abuse, 
hence a child can experience multiple forms of abuse 
and poly-victimization14. While this gives us an 
estimate of global prevalence, the interpretation is 
open to limitations such as no global consensus to the 
definition and indicators of child abuse and neglect 
along with varying ways of data collection and 
methodologies 15. 
 
Child abuse and neglect among children with 
disabilities 
According to an American population-based- 
epidemiological study, as compared to children 
without disabilities, children with disabilities are at 3.7 
times higher risk of physical abuse, 3.14 times higher 
risk for sexual abuse, and 3.8 times higher risk of 
emotional maltreatment 16.  The risk of maltreatment is 
variable within the different types of disabilities17. 
While the study by Sullivan and Knutson16 may not be 
generalized to the population from the developing 
world, it gives a good glimpse and understanding of 
the link between childhood maltreatment and 
disability in detail. Firstly, children with various types 
of disabilities may have a varying risk of the type of 
maltreatment. For example, children with visual 
impairment are more likely to be sexually abused and 
neglected as compared to typically developing peers.16 
Secondly, children with disabilities were more likely 
than children without disabilities to experience 

multiple forms of maltreatment (63% vs. 54.9%, 
respectively) and recurring episodes of maltreatment 
rather than a single episode (71% vs. 29%, 
respectively). For children with and without 
disabilities, it was seen that the perpetrators from 
immediate family accounted for 82.2% of cases of 
physical abuse, 89.5% of emotional abuse and 92.4% of 
neglect cases, whereas 53.1% of cases of child sexual 
abuse were accounted for by immediate and extended 
family members.16 
Thirdly, it can be seen that males with disabilities are 
at a much higher risk for physical abuse and neglect as 
compared to females, however, more females with 
disabilities are at a higher risk for sexual abuse than 
males. Whereas, among the non-disabled, maltreated 
children, girls are significantly more at risk for 
maltreatment including neglect, physical abuse, and 
sexual abuse.16 
Alternatively, in an Australian population-based 
record linkage study it was found that not all 
disabilities have a consistent increased risk of 
maltreatment. After adjusting for child, family and 
neighbourhood risk factors, children with either 
intellectual, conduct disorders or mental/behaviour 
problems had an increased rate of the allegation and 
substantial allegation, whereas children with Down 
Syndrome and birth defects had the same risk as 
children without disabilities.17 
Even though the causal factors associated with 
maltreatment of children with disabilities are very 
similar to those of children without disabilities, certain 
factors increase the risk in children with disabilities. 
These include a higher demand on the caregiver18, 
parental or caregiver stress19, presence of multiple 
caregivers limited access to information or material 
about personal safety and body protection18 poverty, 
illiteracy and lack of awareness 20 and communication 
and cognitive impairment.21 Early identification of risk 
factors for maltreatment associated with family and 
the child and implementation of interventions can 
decrease the stress and in turn prevent child 
maltreatment of children with disabilities.19 
 
Data and research on maltreatment and children 
with disabilities 
Very few studies specifically focus on why children 
with disabilities are at an increased risk for 
maltreatment compared to those without disabilities.22 
Most studies conducted on childhood maltreatment do 
not include disability status as a variable.23 The 
question as to what is the criteria for determining child 
abuse remains. While most studies focus only on 
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substantiated cases of child abuse, useful information 
embedded in suspected and reported cases of child 
abuse is not adequately considered. There is an 
overlap in these criteria but they are not completely in 
sync with each other.24 
 

Pakistan Perspective 
 
CRC observations 
Pakistan ratified the convention on the rights of the 
child in 1990 but maintained its right to interpret the 
articles of the convention in the light of Islamic laws 25. 
In 2011 Pakistan became the 144th country to ratify the 
optional protocols of CRC. These protocols were about 
the child slavery, child pornography, and child 
prostitution. The government has agreed to “continue 
working for the welfare of children, women, and 
persons with disability” during the second Universal 
Periodic Review26 but the execution has been weak.  
According to an alternate report on CRC27 submitted 
by Child Rights Movement (CRM), a network of more 
than 180 civil society organizations working for child 
rights, 48% of the Population of Pakistan comprises of 
children. This is one of the highest ratios in the world.  
The fifth periodic report on CRC submitted by the 
Government of Pakistan reports that there were 82 
million children and adolescents (age 0–19 years) in 
Pakistan and 86 million are the projected estimates for 
the year 2020. These estimates highlight the 
importance of child rights, protection, development, 
and care-related facilities, procedures, and laws. Since 
2010, after the 18th amendment to the Pakistani 
constitution, considerable powers are devolved to the 
provincial governments. Provinces are now 
responsible for legislation, laws, policies, and 
procedures, and the corresponding allocation of 
budget for activities related to child rights and child 
protection. The alternate report suggests to the 
Government of Pakistan to ensure proper compliance 
with UNCRC. Similarly, it recommends that to ensure 
comparative laws, a single definition child needs to be 
adopted.28 
 
Statistics 
Availability of reliable and in time statistics on 
children with disabilities remains a big challenge in 
making informed policies and decisions. It was 
suggested in Pakistan’s National Policy for Persons 
with Disabilities and followed up in its Action Plan 
that modules based on WHO’s International 
Classification of Functioning, Disability, and Health 
(ICF) should be included in the national census. 

Ironically even counting the simple number of existing 
persons with disabilities was included in the 2017 
Pakistan census after a lot of hue and cry by civil 
societies for disabled persons, and yet no other details 
were included. 
Multiple indicator cluster surveys(MICS) 29conducted 
by the bureau of statistics Punjab, did not include any 
specific questionnaire about children with special 
needs. MICS 2017 data available on pre-testing does 
report on the introduction of a dimension on 
functional difficulties faced by children 2 to 17 years. 
Two questionnaires are being used, one for children 
under age five and second for 5 to 17 years old 
children. The questions ask about functional problems 
in hearing, vision, moving, learning & remembering, 
accepting change, making friends, focusing attention, 
etc. Results of the MICS survey report there are 17.9% 
children aged 5-17 who have functional difficulties. 
Hopefully, the introduction of such tools will improve 
the availability of statistics on disabilities. 
Additionally, there is a dearth of data and research on 
child abuse and neglect in Pakistan. No record of 
reported cases is maintained as there is no national or 
provincial Child Protection Management System. Most 
of the information which is gathered is via newspaper 
reports or small-scale studies. 
 
Legislation  
Many international commitments have gradually 
placed pressure as well as paved the way for 
developing policies and legislation for the rights of 
persons with special needs. The same is true for 
Pakistan. While the rights of children/persons with a 
disability were gradually recognized, initially 
emphasis was only focused on creating an enabling 
and safe environment within education and 
employment. 

 First Policy for Persons with Disability 
The first and only policy for persons with disabilities 
was developed in 2002. After that, a National plan of 
action was developed in 2006 to implement ‘national 
policy for persons with disabilities’.30 It was a very 
well-developed document but implementation on the 
plan remained weak.  

 Free and compulsory education for all 
An important milestone in the history of education in 
Pakistan has been in the form of the addition of article 
25A in the constitution through the 18th amendment. 
In 2012 federal government enacted a “free and 
compulsory education act”. It was followed by the 
“Punjab free and compulsory education Act.31 This 
legislation stressed on compulsory and free education 
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for all and included children with special needs and 
disabilities. This paved the way for the gradual 
implementation of inclusive education. Federal and 
provincial governments realized that without 
including children with disabilities in the regular 
schools the goal of education for all could not be 
achieved. 

 Employment opportunities 
In 1981 an Act – ‘disabled persons (employment and 
rehabilitation) ordinance’, was enacted by the 
government of Pakistan. A two percent quota in 
general employment was allocated for workers with 
special needs. For example, if the government 
announces 20 vacancies of primary school teachers, 
two percent of seats are reserved only for persons with 
special needs. Persons with required qualifications and 
having a valid disability certificate can apply against 
those reserved seats.  After devolution of 
responsibilities to the provincial governments, Punjab 
and Khyber Pakhtunkhwa provinces adopted the 
same ordinance while a new law – the Sindh 
differently-abled persons (employment, rehabilitation, 
and welfare) act 2014 was enacted by the Sindh 
government 32. 

 Protection against discrimination 
Article 27 of the Pakistan constitution is regarding 
discrimination in services. It safeguards discrimination 
based on race, religion, place of residence or birth, 
caste, etc. but disability is not written in this article. An 
amendment is required to make sure that disability is 
explicitly mentioned in the article. 32  

 Mental health 
After the independence, Lunacy Act, 1912 remained 
the only act for mental health until it was replaced in 
2001 by the Mental Health Ordinance. However, on 
the ground, it was poorly implemented at the 
provincial level. After devolution of power to 
provinces in 2010, this responsibility was laid on 
provincial governments and they had to adapt or 
enforce a new ordinance to meet requirements of 
changed rules of business. In Sindh “Mental health 
ordinance 2013” is enforced while in Punjab – Punjab 
mental health (amendment) Act 2014 is enacted 33. It 
includes clauses relevant to treatment, admission, and 
deciding guardianship for persons with mental 
impairment.  
Even though the Government of Pakistan has tried to 
address the issue of child abuse and neglect through 
creating laws, the implementation remains weak. Lack 
of clear definitions and proper guidelines to report 
child abuse and neglect is maybe the reason. 34. Child 
Rights Committee of Pakistan Pediatric Association as 

the leader of the core group against Child Sexual 
Abuse helped the government approve a “national 
policy and plan of action (NPA) for children in 2006”. 
Unfortunately, it was never implemented. However, it 
laid the foundation of the ‘Child Protection and 
Welfare Act 2010’ and was passed in one of the 
provinces.  
The legal journey of defining child abuse and neglect 
took a turn with the Criminal Law (Second 
Amendment) Act 2016, which clearly states that "the 
provision in our criminal law statutes fails to cover a 
number of serious offenses and now the safeguards 
provided in this Act will go a long way in protection of 
all children". This Act was passed as an amendment to 
the previous Pakistan Penal Code 1860 and the code of 
Criminal Procedure 1898. It covers very pertinent 
issues including minimum age of criminal 
responsibility, child sexual abuse, internal trafficking, 
cruelty to the child, exposure to seduction and explicit 
material, pornography, and its punishment. Previously 
no law or bill existed which looked at childhood 
maltreatment of children with special needs or 
circumstances. The closest we can get are the 
recommendations of the Child Care Commission in 
2018 by the Lahore High Court Writ Petition No. 
107273/2017 which will pave the way forward to 
protect children with disabilities within educational 
institutes.  
There have been cases of mistreatment with special 
students in special schools. One of these cases where 
children with hearing and speech disabilities were 
physically abused by their special school bus 
conductor in a town in Punjab went viral on social 
media.35 It prompted a petition in Punjab’s Lahore 
High Court by a civil society lawyer in 2017. (Writ 
Petition No. 107273/2017). 
Naeem Zafar, (one of the authors) was inducted by the 
Lahore High Court as Amicus Curiae. Upon the 
request of the Amicus Curiae, the Honourable Chief 
Justice constituted a Child Care Commission in 2018 
and framed its terms of reference and powers to 
formulate recommendations for establishing the 
system of care for children with disabilities. (Order 
sheet for Case no 107273/ 2017). The Commission co-
opted relevant experts, as well as representatives of 
special persons, and constituted four committees on 
inclusive education, health, protection, and legal 
reforms. These committees deliberated for almost 10 
months and their recommendations were finally 
collated and presented as a report to the Lahore High 
Court in October 2018 (C.M No. __ /2018 in W.p No. 
107273/2017). Now we await the court’s decision and 
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its direction to the Punjab Government to implement 
the recommendations of the Child Care Commission.  
Taking a child-centered, multidisciplinary and 
multispectral approach and building on the 
foundation that entire family, which could be nuclear 
or extended including siblings and parents of the child 
with special needs are vital for the child to reach 
his/her potential, a few recommendations were 
suggested. These included:   

 A Commission for the Persons with 
Disabilities to be established by the 
Government of Punjab which could serve as 
an apex body with all stakeholders with due 
representation of gender, skills, geographical 
origin, and other specificities.  

 All laws need to be amended to accommodate 
children with disabilities. 

 The government of the Punjab needs to 
legislate on empowerment and inclusion of 
children with disabilities, mainstreaming all 
mild and moderate children with disabilities 
in private and public schools.  

 The state needs to take adequate measures to 
implement existing frameworks for protecting 
children with disabilities. An independent 
complaint redressal system needs to be 
developed which would provide a platform 
for receiving complaints from children with 
disabilities and their families. 

 A “Resource Directory for Persons with 
Disabilities” including the database of schools, 
vocational training centers, and professional 
services needs to be developed.  

At the federal level different ministries and at the 
provincial level different departments are responsible 
for the wellbeing of and extending services for 
children with special needs, vulnerable groups, and 
minorities. In Punjab the responsibilities are 
distributed according to the Punjab Government rules 
of business, 2011 and ironically, disability being a 
cross-cutting issue, different departments are 
responsible for education, training, health, and 
protection of children with special needs. Children 
enrolled for inclusive education are the responsibility 
of The School Education Department whereas The 
Special Education Department has the responsibility 
for special education programs, development of 
policies, selection and training of teachers, curriculum 
development, teaching, and training of students and 
examination systems.  The Department of Human 
Rights and Minority Affairs deals with violations of 
human rights while The Department of Social Welfare 

has the responsibility of registration of persons with 
special needs, it arranges disability boards at the 
district hospital level in collaboration with the health 
department for issuance of disability certificate. The 
Social Welfare Department also provides vocational 
training, employment guidance, and financial 
assistance to persons with special needs. Similar 
administrative bifurcation is visible in administrative 
responsibilities.8 
A serious gap that hinders the policy-making, budget 
allocation, systems, and procedures and prevents 
better results for the target population, is a lack of 
coordination between departments. While different 
departments develop their sectoral plans, there is a 
need to adopt a multi-sectoral approach to involve 
health, school education, special education, and social 
welfare departments for making unified and 
consolidated strategies. The Child Care Commission 
suggested that there needs to be a mandated 
coordination role of human rights and minority affairs 
department and linkages of the Special Education 
Department with District Education Authorities need 
to be maintained (C.M No. __ /2018 in W.p No. 
107273/2017). 
Alternatively, there are no organized mechanisms or a 
department for managing abused and neglected 
children in the country. The Child Protection Welfare 
Bureau is mandated to look at child abuse cases 
however its focus is mostly on destitute children, 
completely ignoring children with disabilities. Apart 
from one solitary child protection unit at Lahore which 
is a hospital-based model looking at severe cases, there 
is no structured entity to manage cases of abuse and 
neglect. The data maintained at this Child Protection 
Unit is also not disaggregating for disabilities 36. While 
most NGOs look at and report severe cases such as 
that of commercial exploitation and rape, cases of 
physical and emotional abuse often go unnoticed and 
unreported.34 
 
Social Context 
Both nuclear and joint family systems (where 
grandparents and other extended family members live 
together in a family home) prevail in Pakistan.37 
Though gradually awareness and acceptability of 
special needs are increasing in Pakistan, in a poor rural 
family where every member’s contribution to earing 
enables the family to have both ends meet, a child with 
a disability is often considered to be an undue burden. 
Out of poverty, illiteracy, and ignorance, it is very 
hard for the family to provide necessary health, 
nutrition, and training facilities to the child. As about 
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two-thirds of the population lives in rural areas and a 
majority of cases, in joint family settings, a child with a 
disability grows up interacting with members of 
immediate as well as extended family. On one side 
joint family provides psychological and everyday 
support to the parents in taking care of the child but at 
the same time interaction with lots of familiar adults in 
the family increases the risk of being neglected and 
abused by close and trusted ones. Children with 
disabilities can easily fall victim to such inappropriate 
treatment because they are more vulnerable in terms 
of protecting themselves and also reporting such 
behavior. There have been cases where maternal uncle, 
an older cousin, and even domestic workers have been 
involved in the repeated incidence of abuse with these 
children. Quite similar conditions are visible in the 
urban area as well, in the nuclear family system, both 
working parents have to leave the child with a maid or 
at some other relative’s home which increases the risk 
of neglect and abuse.  
In rural areas, when it comes to education and training 
of children with disabilities, the non-availability of 
special schools in villages compels parents to keep 
their child at home, send him/her to a nearby public 
school of regular education or select any religious 
school(madrasa). In public schools, inclusive education 
has not been implemented by the government and 
thus the child faces multiple challenges. On the one 
hand, teachers lack required orientation and training 
and as a consequence, the child faces unacceptability 
and a relatively harsh attitude from the teacher. On the 
other hand, the child gets bullied or mistreated by 
class fellows or other students in school. Many blind 
and physically challenged children in villages end up 
landing in the Madrassas for religious education. 
Teachers working there usually are very strict in 
disciplining the students. Many cases of physical and 
sexual abuse to normal as well as children with 
disabilities have made it to the national media, which 
very well gives us an idea that how bad the condition 
of students with disabilities might be there in 
madrassas as well as in other educational institutions 
in rural areas. In urban areas, academic facilities are 
relatively better but attitudinal, social, and behavioral 
barriers are almost the same. 
There are no mechanisms for managing abused and 
neglected children in the country and apart from one 
solitary child protection unit at Lahore, the systems 
which were recommended in this NPA could not be 
replicated 36While most NGOs look at and report 
severe cases such as that of commercial exploitation 

and rape, cases of physical and emotional abuse often 
go unnoticed and unreported.34  
 
Objectives of the study 
The present study was carried out to discover how 
persons with special needs and persons related to 
them comprehend the construct of child abuse and 
neglect. It was also aimed at identifying the risk factors 
and potential protecting factors in a socio-economic 
and cultural perspective of Pakistan. Objectives of the 
study were to: 
• Analyze the present situation of children with 
special needs in Pakistan, in terms of abuse and 
neglect. 
• Identify the factors that can contribute positively to 
safeguarding children with special needs against 
neglect and abuse. 
 

Materials and Method 
 
The study required in-depth knowledge of the present 
situation of children with special needs in Pakistan, so 
the qualitative approach was considered more 
appropriate. Detailed interviews of persons with 
special needs, their family members, and professionals 
working with special children were conducted to get a 
clear picture of the situation in Pakistan. 
 
Participants 
Purposive sampling was used for the selection of 
participants. Inclusion criteria for persons with special 
needs were “age above 18 years”, “Pakistani national”, 
“ability to communicate verbally, through sign 
language or through any other alternative way” and 
“willingness to participate in the study”.  
For family members and professionals’ inclusion 
criteria were “minimum three years’ experience of 
working with children having special needs”, 
“relevant training & qualification” and “willingness to 
participate in the study”. 30 persons with special 
needs and people related with them were personally 
contacted by the researchers but many of them were 
hesitant to talk about child abuse and eventually 
didn’t show willingness for participating in the study. 
Finally, based on the inclusion criteria, 10 participants 
were selected or the study. Four participants were 
persons with special needs (visual impairment, 
hearing impairment, intellectual impairment, and 
muscular dystrophy), one participant was the mother 
of a special child and five participants were 
professionals working with special children. 
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Table 1: Participants of the study 

Participants N Qualification  
(years of education) 

Age Gender  

Persons with Special Needs 
(visual impairment (n=1), hearing impairment (n=1), 
muscular dystrophy (n=1), intellectual impairment (n=1) 

4 10 – 18  18 – 
43 
years 

Male(3) Female(1) 

Family members of children with special needs 1 16   38 
years 

Male(-) Female(1) 

Professionals working with children having special needs 
(Special educationist (n=1), Psychologist n=2), speech 
therapist (n=1), physical therapist (n-1))  

5 16 - 18 25 – 
47 
years 

Male(1) Female(4) 

 
Data collection and analysis 
An interview guide was developed. It had questions 
on five key areas; a) understanding of constructs of 
disability, neglect and abuse, b) reasons why children 
with special needs are more vulnerable to abuse and 
neglect, c) kinds of abuse children with special needs 
are exposed to, d) personal experience with any victim 
of abuse and neglect, and e) identification of factors 
which could contribute positively to the protection of 
children with special needs. An interview guide was 
then shared with three senior colleagues, having at 
least five year experience of working with children 
having special needs and having a minimum of 18 
years of education. Their suggestions for 
improvements were incorporated into the interview 
guides.  
Once the interview guide was finalized, two research 
assistants were given training, and data was collected 
through them. Standard procedures for qualitative 
data analysis were used to interpret the data. Audio 
recordings of the interviews were transcribed. Each 
file was coded with the ID number of each participant. 
After reading and re-reading the transcriptions word 
to word and sentence to sentence, many open codes 
emerged, which were eventually narrowed to 
categories and themes. At this point, categories and 
themes were shared with senior colleagues for 
suggestions and feedback. These themes were used as 
bases for discussing the findings. 
 

Results 
 
Themes emerging from Interviews provided the bases 
for discussing the findings. Each theme is 
used as a bullet point to describe the findings. 
I. Defining Disability: 
Participants were asked to describe disability. Persons 
with disabilities explained it as “a limitation by birth”, 
“any missing ability” and “a form of human diversity 
which translates into disability due to environmental 

barriers”. A participant with muscular dystrophy 
explained it as a “hardship which should be faced with 
courage and positivity”. Professionals working with 
special children discussed different aspects of 
disability e.g. “limitations in using certain abilities”, 
“different types of special needs”, “different categories 
of severity” etc. 
Almost all participants seemed to focus on the 
“limitation to work independently” dimension of the 
disability. The participant having muscular dystrophy 
explained it as a trial that needs to be faced bravely, 
which is quite understandable as this degenerative 
condition progresses with the tiem. The participant 
with mild intellectual impairment (who was diagnosed 
as having mild intellectual impairment as per the 
assessment record of his education institute) even 
went forward to say that few people consider them a 
burden. 
Based on the views of all participant it became evident 
that almost all were pre-dominantly inclined towards 
a medical model in terms of describing disability. Only 
one participant (with visual impairment) seemed to 
understand the construct of disability from a social 
perspective. He explained “disability is human 
diversity, impairment and disability are two different 
things. If an accessible environment is provided, 
impairment might not translate into disability”. 
II. Meaning of Neglect & Abuse: 
To understand and interpret the responses of 
participants, it was critical to comprehend how they 
perceived the phenomena of child neglect and abuse. 
During the data analysis, it evolved as an important 
theme. To many participants, “neglect” meant 
ignoring or paying less attention to others. Many 
professionals in the sample thought that abuse was far 
more serious than neglect. To them, if peers, siblings, 
family, and teachers are less social or warm towards 
children with special needs, it is a form of neglect. It 
became quite clear that neglecting the presence and 
needs of special children was more close to their 
understanding of the concept of neglect. A special 
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educationist explained that “neglect refers to not 
giving attention or ignoring a person”. The participant 
with intellectual impairment said that “because special 
people are not capable of doing something substantial, 
they are neglected by others”.  
“Abuse” on the other hand was better understood the 
way societies tend to explain it as compared to neglect. 
Many different types of abuse were discussed by the 
participants e.g. physical, sexual, psychological, 
verbal, etc. A psychologist described the abuse as “any 
kind of bad words or actions which disturbs or inflict 
pain on others”. The abuse was defined by a speech 
therapist as “something imposed on someone or 
compelling someone to do something unwillingly”. 
Few participants even shared that due to recent events 
of child abuse surfacing on media and consequent 
media campaigns have contributed positively in 
increasing understanding of child protection and 
safety in Pakistan. Although no inference can be made 
based on the small number of participants, it did 
suggest that media is gradually opening up to this 
issue and people are getting sensitized through media.  
III. Children with special needs are at higher risk of 
abuse & neglect: 
All participants shared that children with special 
needs are at a higher risk of being abused and 
neglected. According to the speech therapist, “children 
with special needs have challenges in understanding 
non-verbal cues, therefore they fail to understand and 
respond appropriately to the behaviors of others”. 
Their difficulty in communication places them at a 
higher risk of exploitation. It was shared by the 
participants that because many children with special 
needs are highly dependent on their family members 
and caregivers for meeting their basic needs, so they 
are more exposed to the potential risk of abuse. At 
times these children are physically abused by the 
frustrated caregivers and family members. Not being 
able to meet the expectations of others, dependence on 
others, difficulty in understanding the intentions of 
others, inability to appropriately communicating how 
they are treated, and potential neglect by the 
caregivers, all these factors put them at a higher risk of 
being abused. 
IV. Types of abuse children with special needs are 
exposed to: 
Many participants shared that children with special 
needs are potentially at risk of verbal, physical, and 
sexual abuse. The participant with muscular 
dystrophy shared that “hiding children with special 
needs from the society and denying them of their basic 
rights of participation, independence and respect are 

also a form of abuse”. According to the participant 
with hearing impairment “lack of appropriate 
emotional and social support from the family and 
siblings sometimes leads them to depend more on 
external social circles. This over-dependence on 
external groups can expose them to exploitation and 
abuse”. Psychologists and special educationists shared 
that moderate to severe disabilities, especially those 
affecting communication abilities e.g. Autism 
spectrum disorder, cerebral palsy, and intellectual 
impairments, put children at a greater risk of being 
abused and neglected. 
The Mother of a special child reported that not only 
children with special needs but their families are also a 
victim of constant abuse. Negative people call these 
children with bad names, mock their actions and don’t 
let their typically growing children be friends with 
special children. Constant stares by the general public 
make it difficult for the family to go to public parks, 
markets, and other social environments. 
According to the participants if these children are 
abused or maltreated, parents usually do not report, 
rather they tend to hide these cases due to a) 
stigmatizing, b) involvement of family members in 
abuse, or c) to avoid social pressures.  
Four participants shared that they have come across 
children with special needs who were 
physically/emotionally/sexually abused by their 
caregivers, drivers, or other support staff at home. 
They also shared that once these cases were reported 
to the parents, most parents tried to change their home 
environment to ensure the safety of their children. 
V. Positive and negative factors in society: 
According to the participants, certain risk factors in 
Pakistani society make children with special needs 
more vulnerable to abuse and neglect. These factors 
specifically include lack of awareness, illiteracy, and 
poverty of parents.  
Participants shared that lack of parental guidance, 
financial challenges associated with disability & health 
impairments, lack of governmental support, 
insufficient medical & training facilities, and in some 
cases non-supportive behavior of extended family also 
make situation more critical.  
Participants shared that in most cases, joint family 
system helps in keeping children safe from abuse.  
Joint families are a source of support for the parents, 
not only in parenting but also in keeping children in 
safe hands and protecting them from potential abuse 
and neglect.  
Two participants shared that in their opinion rural 
setting is more responsive to needs of special children. 
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In rural settings habitants live in a very closely knitted 
social network where people know each other very 
well. This close network contributes to social support 
and acceptance of diversity with a more open heart. 
Older members of rural society also help in providing 
a safe social environment for all. 
VI. How to protect children with special needs from 
abuse & neglect: 
An important theme that surfaced during analysis was 
about suggested changes in the environment for 
improving the situation regarding abuse & neglect of 
children with special needs. Most participants shared 
that the issue of child abuse has sprung up on the 
media after certain cases of child sexual abuse, but 
abuse and neglect of children with special needs 
remains a highly neglected area.  
Participants expressed that concentrated and 
structured efforts are required to use different forms of 
media for raising awareness on abuse & neglect of 
children with special needs. This will help in busting 
myths about disability and will create a more positive 
image of people with disabilities. A more socially 
supportive and positive environment will help in 
making our society a more secure and safe place for 
children with special needs. 
According to the mother of a special child, “parents 
are the main actors for ensuring healthy personality 
development and safety of their child with special 
needs”. Parents must be given proper guidance and 
training so they can impart proper training to their 
children.  
 

Discussion 
 
While the overall state of children in Pakistan is 
ranked among the lowest in the world (Kids Rights 
Index, 2019), the rights of children with disabilities are 
further at risk. The topic of child abuse and neglect is 
considered taboo, so is the topic of disabilities which 
has an aspect of social stigma attached to it. There are 
little data and very limited research on the issue of 
child maltreatment among children with disabilities 22. 
Although the present study had a limited number of 
participants, it does provide insights and grounds for 
more elaborated studies. There is a dire need for a 
centralized database that collects data from various 
sources to understand the dynamics of abuse among 
children with and without disabilities 36. 
We found during this limited study that according to 
the respondents, the definition of disability has 
evolved. It was seen that disability was defined more 
along the lines of the medical model as compared to 

the social or the systems model. Additionally, 
participants of this study reinforced the notion of 
“limitation to work independently” as a definition of 
disability. This may be linked to how it has been 
focused within the national context through the legal 
journey. As the journey of disability within Pakistan 
evolved, there was a strong focus on education and 
employment. It was only recently through the 
deliberations and then the report of the Child Care 
Commission, that issues of child maltreatment and 
rights of the children were connected to disability. The 
recommendations of the Child Care Commission have 
yet to be adopted by the government and then only 
can we expect a change in the rights-based perspective 
of childhood disabilities 
Similarly, the global consensus to defining the 
indicators of child abuse and neglect and varying 
methods of data collection 15 have added to the 
challenge of understanding child abuse and neglect in 
the disability context. In Pakistan exposure to media 
events 35 has not only revealed how child abuse and 
neglect are understood but have also contributed to 
stronger interest and awareness.  Consistent with 
previous research, the findings suggested that children 
with disabilities are at a higher risk due to 
communication and cognitive impairment 21, higher 
demand on the caregiver 18, parental or caregiver 
stress, leading to child maltreatment 19 and presence of 
multiple caregivers. They are at an increased risk due 
to lack of parental guidance 18, poverty, illiteracy, and 
lack of awareness 20, lack of legislation, efficient 
administration, service provision, and overall 
government support. 
While previous researches have established that most 
abuse is perpetrated by immediate or extended family 
members 16, findings from this study highlight the 
protective role of the family. Immediate and extended 
family, especially grandparents are very protective of 
children with disabilities. Social support from family 
members eases the burden on the parents and helps in 
protecting the child. However, it was also seen from 
the findings that the non-supportive attitude of 
extended family members and their negative attitude 
can be a risk factor. Similarly, participants of this study 
felt that closely knitted social fabric especially in rural 
settings adds to acceptance of diversity and helps the 
child be included in the society. However, previous 
research suggests how increased dependence on 
multiple caregivers  can be a potential risk factor. 
More research needs to be conducted to understand 
the dynamics of joint families and closely-knit social 
networks in collective cultures such as that of Pakistan 



45                                                 Children Rights Journal of Rawalpindi Medical University (CRJRMU); 2021; 1(1): 35-46  

and prevention efforts need to include them as major 
stakeholders. 
The challenges within the legal and administrative 
systems including lack of proper definitions and 
understanding, awareness among policymakers along 
communication and coordination among departments 
have created systematic loopholes which make 
children with disabilities even more at risk. While the 
Child Care Commission by Lahore High court (C.M 
No. __ /2018 in W.p No. 107273/2017) has paved the 
way for protecting children with disabilities, 
implementation seems to be a farfetched idea. It can be 
seen that suggestions from the study are very similar 
to the Child Care Commission 2018 recommendations 
pointing towards a rights-based, multidisciplinary, 
child-centered approach with family being a key 
stakeholder. The need for awareness-raising and 
training of children with disabilities, parents, and 
professionals about child maltreatment is also 
emphasized. 
To provide a safe and enabling environment for every 
child, with or without a disability, and to fulfill UN-
CRC commitments and Sustainable Development 
Goals, we need to take a holistic, child-centered, 
multidisciplinary approach and understand that we 
need to act quickly to protect children from all kinds of 
maltreatment. 
 

Limitations 
  
This study only provides a glimpse of child 
maltreatment among children with disabilities in 
Pakistan. Although a diverse sample was selected for 
in-depth interviews, views of the participants cannot 
be generalized and the sample is not representative of 
the whole population. The participants were from 
urban areas, where facilities are present for children 
with disabilities. Understanding and situation might 
be different in rural areas and where factors such as 
poverty, parental education, overall literacy rates, 
parental mental health interplay. This also calls for 
larger and broad-based studies and data collection on 
the topic of Child Maltreatment within the context of 
Children with Disabilities. 
 

Conclusion 
  
Despite its limitations, this study is one of the first to 
look at child maltreatment among children with 
disabilities within the Pakistani context. Child 
maltreatment and disabilities are a neglected topic not 

only for research but within the policy, legal, and 
social context. This small study provided a glimpse of 
how child maltreatment among children with 
disabilities is understood by professionals working 
with them and emphasizes the systematic loopholes 
making it difficult to protect these children. Further 
research needs to be conducted looking at dynamics of 
interaction between children with disabilities and 
various stakeholders, the association of joint family 
structure and collective cultures, systems of protecting 
children with disabilities, perceived and actual 
protective and risk factors and how to include and 
respect the views of persons with disabilities and 
professionals working with them.  
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